
Scott County Administration Department

Purchasing Division

Telephone:  (563) 326-8793

BID TABULATION SHEET

Date: 9/27/2017

Requesting Department:   IT

Requisition No.    19344

ITEM Epson TM-H6000IV Zebra GX430T Total Lead Time

Emgence $456.00 $422.00 $878.00

Hypertec $544.21 $435.73 $979.94

Erb's $625.00 $389.00 1014

Barbara Technologies $554.50 $515.00 $1,069.50

Thomas Consultants 655.22 425.88 $1,081.10 7 days

Insight $616.60 $473.00 $1,089.60

OM Office Supply 645 500 $1,145.00 10-15 days

JPC $737.56 $465.18 $1,202.74

Howard $634.00 $580.00 $1,214.00 3-5 days

Troxell 670 561 $1,231.00

TKK Electronics 600 642 15 sh $1,257.00

Royal Media 674.37 625.23 15 sh $1,314.60

Coast to Coast $675.00 $665.00 $1,340.00

Evergreen $495.00 $875.00 $1,370.00

Office Tree $982.87 $714.00 $1,696.87 5-7 days

SDF Professional incorrect quote incorrect quote

KT's no bid no bid

Laser Resources no bid no bid

Lee Ryder Laminate no bid no bid

Scan Technology no price no price 2-7 days


